LANARK
COUNTY

PW-C-01-2024-24-E0

CR36 Bollingbroke Road Rehabilitation

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"
$517,403.90
Crains' Construction Limited
$546,143.00
Arnott Brothers Construction
$605,156.54

Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

Tyt (e

February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Dir&ctor of Public Works

Date

February 7, 2024

JogmFratt, Business Manfxger Public Works

Date




W PW-C-02-2024-24-E0
COUNTY
CRe6 Christie Lake Road

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

$526,250.00
G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited

$599,075.37
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

$632,894.00
GIP Paving Inc.

$677,000.00

R.W. Tomlinson Limited

/
( W I/VZ‘ (/V"’"—" February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Df're'ctor of Public Works Date

ﬂﬁ QJ /&f" February 7, 2024

Jqﬁ: ratt, éusiness Mavnager Public Works Date

i,




]_AN% PW-C-03-2024-24-E0
COuU

CR511 Highway 511 Road Rehabilitation

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

$1,065,050.08
Crains' Construction Limited

$1,086,000.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

$1,110,821.65
Arnott Brothers Construction

$1,149,646.00
GIP Paving Inc.

$1,202,466.22
McCrea Excavation Ltd.

$1,311,000.00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited

‘7,0’;‘4‘/"7 m ¢ /é‘lmz February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Dfrecfar of Public Works Date

ﬁ.— “ ﬂw/ﬁ February 7, 2024
(a/ﬁ'%n, Business Manager Public Works Date




]_ANMK PW-C-05-2024-24-E0
COUNTY
Road Rehabilitation of County Road 20 (Kinburn Side Road)

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

$746,000.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

$787,062.76
Crains' Construction Limited

$791,869.00
GIP Paving Inc.

$807,359.75
Arnott Brothers Construction

$843,344.33
McCrea Excavation Ltd.

$938,000.00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited

(VQ’V\/‘\/% M é"‘—’ February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Directo of Public Works Date

ﬂu.. ﬂm}/ ﬁ'? February 7, 2024

Jozryrt, Business Manager Public Works Date




LANARK PW-C-06-2024-24-E0
COUNTY

Road Rehabilitation of CR 43 (Highway 43)

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

$1,667,762.50
G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited

$1,989,978.00
GIP Paving Inc.

$2,019,000.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

$2,153,000.00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited

(/(’-é’l*"/‘f m" é"f February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Df't[ector of Public Works Date

ﬂu M February 7, 2024

Joan f«;(, Business Manager Public Works Date



LAN ARK PW-C-07-2024-24-E0
COUNTY
Road Rehabilitation of CR 10 (Scotch Line Road)

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A" Scotch Line Rd Schedule "B" North St. Schedule "C" Scotch Line/North St.

G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited $1,075,426.00 $82,350.00 $5,000.00
Crains' Construction Limited $1,205,291.40 $98,740.00 $4,500.00
Arnott Brothers Construction $1,226,995.50 $83,320.00 $3,100.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited $1,314,839.66 $122,810.34 $3,000.00
GIP Paving Inc. $1,400,302.00 $92,775.00 $1,670.00
G. Williams Paving Inc $1,440,900.50 $97,940.00 $3,300.00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited $1,515,409.60 $115,288.40 $3,302.00
/-

{ ‘2/’/" '¢ /W ( ( v February 7, 2024
Terry McCann, Dire(tor of Public Works Date

ﬂd}? February 7, 2024

7 mrt, Business Mdnager Public Works Date




LANARK PW-C-08-2024-24-E0
COUNTY
Road Rehabilitation of CR16 (South Lavant Road)

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

$740,261.50
Crains' Construction Limited

$753,345.55
Arnott Brothers Construction

$820,000.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited

(W bnr— February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Director of Public Works Date

ﬂwx— ﬂ-m%) February 7, 2024

Joa /att, Business Mafager Public Works Date




LANARK PW-C-09-2024-24-EQ
COUNTY
2024 Micro Surfacing

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary
Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficlat Value or Notes
Schedule "A-C" Lanark County Roads Schedule "D-G" Beckwith Schedule "H" Montague Schedule "|" Tay Valley Township Schedule "K" Mississippi Mills
$1,058,625.00 $322,742.50 $150,240,00 $188,950.00 $56,780.75
Miller Paving Limited
$1,440,824.40 $514,109.00 $213,864,00 $266,256.76 $100,547.85
Duncor Enterprises Ine.

M m( <7¢f'v--f""""‘-~ February 7, 2024

Terry McCanh, Dlrecta1ol Public Works Date

”f-— ﬁj/ ﬁ February 7, 2024

doun Prdtt, BusmrsfManager Public Works Date




IANMK PW'C'10'2024'24'E0
COUNTY
The Placement of a Stress Absorbing Membrane Interlayer

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A" - CR6 Christie Lake Schedule "B" - CR10 Scotch
. Schedule "C" - CR10 North St.
Road Line Road
Walker Construction Limited $182,600.00 $214,900.00 $26,300.00
Miller Paving Limited $187,480.00 $221,820.00 $33,220.00

{7;:\;71/{ M/l‘ (:;M"“‘ February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Dlrﬂ:mrtf Public Works Date

o M February 7, 2024

JoapFratt, Budiness Manoger Public Works Date




LANARK PW-C-12-2024-24-E0
COUNTY

Shoulder Gravel Placement

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A" CR6 Christie Lake Rd. Schedule "B" CR12 McDonalds Corners Rd.

G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited $69,300.00 $108,750.00
Arnott Brothers Construction $90,527.50 $129,750.00
Crains' Construction Limited $91,487.50 $140,750.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited $123,251.50 $176,250.00

4‘1/(4 M L (/&-"V\.M—- ' February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Dr‘re{cror of Public Works Date

% W February 7, 2024
7'(!’ att, Busthess Monager Public Works Date




LANARK
COUNTY

Vendor

PW-C-13-2024-24-E0

Culvert Replacement

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Unofficial Value or Notes

Unofficial Value or Notes

Schedule "B" - CR10 Seotch

Unofficial Value or Notes ~ Unofficial Value or Notes

Schedule "C" - CR29 Highway Schedule "C" CR 29 Provisional

Unofficlal Value or Notes

Schedule "C" CR29 - Provisional

Schedule "A" - CR6 Christie Lake Road Line Road 29 Item 1 (Steel Pipe) Item 2 (Concrete )
G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited $117,480.00 $67,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dig'N Dirt Ltd. $195,484.10 $97,888.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Campbells Trucking Ltd $204,984.00 $134,885.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Arnott Brothers Construction $147,460.00 $91,525.00 $14,500.00 $39,675.00. $53,245.00
Goldie Mohr Ltd. $159,264.00 $105,280.00 $12,870.00 $36,639.00 $47,426.00
Crains' Construction Limited $171,540.00 $113,850.00 $9,900.00 $37,375.00 $49,450.00
Scott Trudeau Construction Corp $181,051.78 $109,822.75 $18,274.70 $38,573.53 $51,531.50
McCrea Excavation Ltd. $181,940.40 $117,769.00 $13,500.00 $37,483.79 $53,766.18
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited $168,239.47 $126,741.15 $16,897.70 $39,464.55 $59,185.90
Trilith Contracting Inc. $193,121,46 $121,914,20 $39,250.00 $30,933.16 $59,362.31
Premier North Ltd. $208,000.00 $147,800.00 $14,600.00 $46,000,00 $62,100.00
Municipal Maintenance Inc $206,300.00 $178,600,00 $13,450.00 $67,850.00 $132,250,00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited $401,487.80 $213,518.00 $36,335.00 $51,391.20 $96,841.50

—(ory Wl (o

February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Director o blic Works

it

Date

February 7, 2024

Joan P !t, usfﬂess“dunagl:r Public Works

Date



[ANARK
COUNTY

Vendor

PW-C-27-2024-25-E2

Hot Mix Patching

Closing Date: Wednesday, February 7, 2024

Submission Summary

Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A"

G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited

$113,400.00

(7;;4 //%téw~—~~

February 7, 2024

Terry McCann, Dirq/ctor Jf Public Works

%

Date

February 7, 2024

Joan Wusmeﬁ Manage; Public Works

Date




